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Dear editor
The article with the title “Rampart of Health-Specific Leadership and Social Support of Colleagues to Overcome Burnout 
in an Emotionally Demanding Situations: The Mediating Role of Stress” is very useful for human resource health 
management, because it has the following advantages: 1) focuses on employee psychosocial factors, namely the role of 
emotional demands, health-specific leadership, and social support from co-workers in influencing work stress and 
fatigue; 2) data were collected at two different times so that cause-and-effect relationships could be better understood; 3) 
examines the mediating role of stress in the relationship between social support from coworkers and job burnout, as well 
as between health-specific leadership and job burnout; 4) contributes to the understanding of factors that can improve 
employee psychological health, as a basis for developing interventions and management strategies.1

However, we have also identified the limitations of this research, namely: 1) the sample is limited to technical 
workers, so the generalization of the findings is limited to this population;2 2) potential perception bias because data were 
collected through self-report questionnaires;3 2) the potential for common method bias because the data are obtained 
from a single source;3 3) some variables are measured with only a few items;4 4) although this research uses control 
variables (gender, age, and education), there are other factors that can influence the relationship between variables, which 
are not measured; 5) the absence of further analysis of contextual factors that might influence the relationship between 
variables, such as organizational culture or specific job characteristics.

Therefore, to improve the results of this research in the future, we recommend: 1) expanding the research sample to 
other industries or sectors, also involving respondents from various levels and backgrounds so that more comprehensive 
insights are obtained; 2) using experimental or longitudinal designs to strengthen analysis of cause-and-effect relation-
ships; 3) use observation or interview methods in collecting data to obtain a more in-depth perspective; 4) control or 
include other variables in the analysis to understand the influence of contextual variables, such as organizational culture 
or job characteristics; 5) use path analysis or multilevel analysis to obtain a deeper understanding of the relationship 
between the variables studied.5 It is hoped that the results of this further research will provide better results, which can be 
used by stakeholders in decision making.
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